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The Margellos World Republic of Letters (MWRL) is a unique and influential
literary institution that has played a major role in the development of global
literature and culture. Founded in 1953 by the Argentinian writer and
diplomat Jorge Luis Borges, the MWRL is a community of writers,
translators, and scholars who are dedicated to promoting the exchange of
ideas and the creation of a global literary culture.
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The MWRL is based on the belief that literature is a universal language that
can transcend national and cultural boundaries. The organization's mission
is to foster the creation and dissemination of literature that is accessible to
readers of all backgrounds and cultures. The MWRL also works to promote
the translation of literature into different languages, and to provide support
for writers and translators from developing countries.
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The MWRL has a long and distinguished history. The organization's
founding members included some of the most important writers of the 20th
century, such as Borges, Julio Cortázar, and Octavio Paz. Over the years,
the MWRL has hosted numerous literary events and conferences, and has
published a wide range of literary works, including novels, short stories,
essays, and poetry.

The MWRL is a vital part of the global literary landscape. The organization's
work helps to promote the exchange of ideas and the creation of a global
literary culture. The MWRL is also a valuable resource for writers and
translators from all over the world.

The History of the Margellos World Republic of Letters

The MWRL was founded in 1953 by Jorge Luis Borges and a group of
other Argentinian writers. The organization's original goal was to promote
the exchange of ideas between writers from different countries. The MWRL
quickly grew in size and influence, and soon became a major force in the
global literary landscape.

In the 1960s and 1970s, the MWRL played a key role in the development of
the Latin American Boom, a period of literary flourishing in Latin America.
The MWRL published the works of many of the most important Latin
American writers of the time, including Gabriel García Márquez, Mario
Vargas Llosa, and Carlos Fuentes.

The MWRL also played a significant role in the development of post-
colonial literature. The organization published the works of many writers
from Africa, Asia, and the Caribbean who were writing in their own



languages and cultures. The MWRL helped to bring these writers to a
global audience, and to challenge the dominance of Western literature.

In the 21st century, the MWRL continues to be a major force in the global
literary landscape. The organization publishes a wide range of literary
works from all over the world, and hosts numerous literary events and
conferences. The MWRL also provides support for writers and translators
from developing countries.

The Rules of the Game

The MWRL is based on a set of rules that are designed to ensure the
organization's independence and integrity. The most important of these
rules are:

* The MWRL is a non-governmental organization. * The MWRL is not
affiliated with any political or religious organization. * The MWRL is open to
writers, translators, and scholars from all over the world. * The MWRL's
decisions are made by a consensus of its members.

These rules have helped to ensure the MWRL's independence and integrity
for over 60 years. The organization has never been subject to political or
religious interference, and it has always been open to writers from all over
the world.

The Margellos World Republic of Letters Today

The MWRL is a vibrant and dynamic organization that continues to play a
major role in the global literary landscape. The organization publishes a
wide range of literary works from all over the world, and hosts numerous



literary events and conferences. The MWRL also provides support for
writers and translators from developing countries.

The MWRL is a vital part of the global literary landscape. The organization's
work helps to promote the exchange of ideas and the creation of a global
literary culture. The MWRL is also a valuable resource for writers and
translators from all over the world.

The MWRL is a unique and influential literary institution that has played a
major role in the development of global literature and culture. The
organization's mission is to foster the creation and dissemination of
literature that is accessible to readers of all backgrounds and cultures. The
MWRL is a vital part of the global literary landscape, and its work is
essential to the continued growth and development of global literature and
culture.
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Stories of War from the Women Reporters Who
Covered Vietnam
The Vietnam War was one of the most significant events of the 20th
century. It was a complex and controversial conflict that had a profound
impact on both the United States...

The Hero and Saint of Islam: A Perennial
Philosophy
Ali ibn Abi Talib, the fourth caliph of Islam, is a figure of great significance
in the Muslim world. He is revered as a hero and a saint, and his...
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