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Dwight D. Eisenhower was one of the most influential figures in American
history. As a general during World War II, he led the Allied forces to victory
in Europe. As the 34th President of the United States, he oversaw the end
of the Korean War and the beginning of the Cold War. In this
comprehensive biography, acclaimed historian Stephen Ambrose provides
a detailed and captivating account of Eisenhower's life and career.
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Ambrose begins by tracing Eisenhower's early life and education. Born in
Denison, Texas, in 1890, Eisenhower grew up in a poor family. He attended
West Point Military Academy and graduated in 1915. After serving in World
War I, Eisenhower rose through the ranks of the U.S. Army. In 1942, he
was appointed Supreme Allied Commander in Europe. Under Eisenhower's
leadership, the Allied forces launched the D-Day invasion of Normandy in
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1944. The invasion was a success, and it helped to turn the tide of the war
in favor of the Allies.

After the war, Eisenhower served as Chief of Staff of the U.S. Army. In
1952, he was elected President of the United States. As President,
Eisenhower oversaw the end of the Korean War and the beginning of the
Cold War. He also signed the Civil Rights Act of 1957, which outlawed
segregation in public places. Eisenhower left office in 1961, and he died in
1969.

Ambrose's biography of Eisenhower is a masterful work of scholarship.
Ambrose draws on a wide range of sources, including Eisenhower's
personal papers, interviews with his family and friends, and declassified
government documents. The result is a comprehensive and nuanced
portrait of one of the most important figures in American history.

Eisenhower: Soldier and President is a must-read for anyone interested in
American history, World War II, or the presidency. Ambrose's clear and
engaging writing style makes this book accessible to readers of all levels.
Eisenhower's story is one of courage, leadership, and determination. It is a
story that will inspire and educate readers for generations to come.

Praise for Eisenhower: Soldier and President

"Stephen Ambrose has written a magisterial biography of one of the most
important figures in American history. Eisenhower: Soldier and President is
a must-read for anyone interested in American history, World War II, or the
presidency." - David McCullough, author of John Adams and Truman



"Ambrose's biography of Eisenhower is a masterpiece of scholarship. It is
the definitive work on one of the most important figures in American
history." - Robert Dallek, author of Franklin D. Roosevelt and Ronald
Reagan

"Eisenhower: Soldier and President is a superb biography. Ambrose has
captured the essence of Eisenhower's character and leadership. This book
is a must-read for anyone interested in American history." - Michael
Beschloss, author of The Conquerors and Presidential Courage

About the Author

Stephen Ambrose was an acclaimed historian and biographer. He wrote
over 30 books, including the Pulitzer Prize-winning Undaunted Courage:
Meriwether Lewis, Thomas Jefferson, and the Opening of the American
West. Ambrose died in 2002.

Additional Resources

Dwight D. Eisenhower Presidential Library and Museum

Dwight D. Eisenhower

Dwight D. Eisenhower
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